

| Bid #15-3348 Transformers for the North Little Rock Electric Department |  |          |                 |               |                    |               |             |               |  |
|---|--|----------|-----------------|---------------|--------------------|---------------|-------------|---------------|--|
| ITEM NO   | Description  | Quantity | HD Supply       |               | Wholesale Electric |               | Wesco       |               |  |
|   |  |          | Unit Price      | Delivery Date | Unit Price         | Delivery Date | Unit Price  | Delivery Date |  |
| ZB02524   | 25KVA 120/240 - SINGLE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 3        | \$1,535.00      | 10 Weeks      | No Bid             |               | \$ 1,523.00 | 8-10 Weeks    |  |
| ZB05024   | 50KVA 120/240 - SINGLE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 3        | \$1,917.00      | 10 Weeks      | No Bid             |               | \$ 1,800.00 | 8-10 Weeks    |  |
| ZB07524   | 75KVA 120/240 - SINGLE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 1        | \$2,143.00      | 10 Weeks      | No Bid             |               | \$ 2,149.00 | 8-10 Weeks    |  |
|   | Manufacturer                                       |          | Central Moloney |               |                    |               |             |               |  |
| ZB30028   | 300KVA 120/208 - THREE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 10       | \$8,700.00      | 14-16 Weeks   | \$10,424.00        |               | \$8,377.25  | 8-10 Weeks    |  |
| ZB75028   | 750KVA 120/208 - THREE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 2        | \$16,849.00     | 14-16 Weeks   | \$22,366.00        |               | \$13,642.25 | 10-12 Weeks   |  |
|   | Manufacturer                                       |          | CG Power        |               | Camtran            |               | Cooper      |               |  |
|   | Opened by: Amy Smith                               |          |                 |               |                    |               |             |               |  |
|   | Summary by: Crystal Willis                         |          |                 |               |                    |               |             |               |  |

| Bid #15-3348 Transformers for the North Little Rock Electric Department |  |          |                   |               |                   |               |             |               |               |
|---|--|----------|-------------------|---------------|-------------------|---------------|-------------|---------------|---------------|
| ITEM NO   | Description  | Quantity | AR Electric Co Op |               | Irby              |               | Irby        |               | Delivery Date |
|   |  |          | Unit Price        | Delivery Date | Unit Price        | Delivery Date | Unit Price  | Delivery Date |               |
| ZB02524   | 25KVA 120/240 - SINGLE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 3        | \$1,584.00        | 9-11 Weeks    | \$2,142.00        | 8-10 Weeks    | No Bid      |               |               |
| ZB05024   | 50KVA 120/240 - SINGLE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 3        | \$1,838.00        | 9-11 Weeks    | \$2,420.00        | 8-10 Weeks    | No Bid      |               |               |
| ZB07524   | 75KVA 120/240 - SINGLE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 1        | \$2,239.00        | 9-11 Weeks    | \$3,254.00        | 8-10 Weeks    | No Bid      |               |               |
| ZB30028   | 300KVA 120/208 - THREE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 10       | \$8,203.00        | 9-11 Weeks    | \$9,211.00        | 8-10 Weeks    | \$8,703.00  |               | 14-16 Weeks   |
| ZB75028   | 750KVA 120/208 - THREE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 2        | \$12,472.00       | 9-11 Weeks    | \$16,244.00       | 8-10 Weeks    | \$16,939.00 |               | 14-16 Weeks   |
|   | Manufacturer                                       |          | Ermco             |               | Howard Industries |               | CG Power    |               |               |
|   | Opened by: Amy Smith                               |          |                   |               |                   |               |             |               |               |
|   | Summary by: Crystal Willis                         |          |                   |               |                   |               |             |               |               |

| Bid #15-3348 Transformers for the North Little Rock Electric Department |  |          |             |               |            |               |            |               |  |
|---|--|----------|-------------|---------------|------------|---------------|------------|---------------|--|
| ITEM NO   | Description  | Quantity | Techline    |               |            |               |            |               |  |
|   |  |          | Unit Price  | Delivery Date | Unit Price | Delivery Date | Unit Price | Delivery Date |  |
| ZB02524   | 25KVA 120/240 - SINGLE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 3        | \$1,809.00  | 10-12 Weeks   |            |               |            |               |  |
| ZB05024   | 50KVA 120/240 - SINGLE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 3        | \$2,030.00  | 10-12 Weeks   |            |               |            |               |  |
| ZB07524   | 75KVA 120/240 - SINGLE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 1        | \$2,237.00  | 10-12 Weeks   |            |               |            |               |  |
| ZB30028   | 300KVA 120/208 - THREE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 10       | \$7,204.00  | 6-8 Weeks     |            |               |            |               |  |
| ZB75028   | 750KVA 120/208 - THREE PHASE PAD MOUNT TRANSFORMER | 2        | \$11,724.00 | 8-10 Weeks    |            |               |            |               |  |
|   | Manufacturer                                       |          | ABB         |               |            |               |            |               |  |
|   | Opened by: Amy Smith                               |          |             |               |            |               |            |               |  |
|   | Summary by: Crystal Willis                         |          |             |               |            |               |            |               |  |