
         CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 17-3487 SUMMARY                     

         Friday, September 8, 2017 @ 10:00a.m. 

Opened by:   Amy Smith 

Summary by: Crystal Willis 

 

 

 

 

 

  

Transformers for the NLRED 
 

Paradoxe Corp. Anixter Anixter AR Electric Co Op 

 

Present at Bid Opening     

Dead Front Single Phase Pad Mounted Distribution  

Six (6) 25KVA @ $ 8508.00 No Bid 1989.00 1497.00 

 

Three (3) 50KVA @ $ 5283.00 No Bid  2218.00 1709.00 

Four (4) 75KVA @ $ 8636.00 No Bid  2625.00 1973.00 

 

Four (4) 100KVA @ $ 10,428.00 No Bid  2880.00 2395.00 

Three Phase Dead Front Pad Mounted Transformers 

Five (5) 150KVA 120/240V @ $ 31,075.00 31,688.00 

9211.00 

Alt: 874.00 6292.00 

 

Four (4) 300KVA 120/208V @ $ 31,440.00 32,288.00 
10,044.00 

Alt: 10,430.00 7735.00 

 

One (1) 1000KVA 277/480V @ $ 11,452.00 13,678.00 
17,161.00 

Alt: 17,556.00 13,530.00 

 

Manufacturer: Magnetron CG Power Central Maloney Ermco 

 

Delivery:  14-16 Weeks 14-16 Weeks 8-12 Weeks 8-10 Weeks 

 

Additional Information     
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Transformers for the NLRED 
 

Irby  Irby Wesco Border States 

 

Present at Bid Opening     

Dead Front Single Phase Pad Mounted Distribution  

Six (6) 25KVA @ $ 1979.00 No Bid 1889.47 1671.00 

 

Three (3) 50KVA @ $ 2207.00 No Bid 2335.42 2111.00 

Four (4) 75KVA @ $ 2612.00 No Bid 2890.75 2182.00 

 

Four (4) 100KVA @ $ 2865.00 No Bid 2695.54 2630.00 

Three Phase Dead Front Pad Mounted Transformers 

Five (5) 150KVA 120/240V @ $ 

8314.00 
Alt.: LB Switch 

8697.00 6306.00 7839.37 7349.00 

 

Four (4) 300KVA 120/208V @ $ 

9992.00 
Alt.: LB Switch 

10,377.00 8032.00 9646.24 8798.00 

 

One (1) 1000KVA 277/480V @ $ 

17,074.00 
Alt.: LB Switch 

17,466.00 13,614.00 16,917.46 14932.00 

 

Manufacturer: Central Maloney CG Power  GE 

 

Delivery:  

8-10 Weeks & 

10-12 Weeks  14-16 Weeks 8-12 Weeks 9-14 Weeks 

 

Additional Information     
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Transformers for the NLRED 
 

Techline Techline 
Technology 

International 
 

 

Present at Bid Opening     

Dead Front Single Phase Pad Mounted Distribution  

Six (6) 25KVA @ $ 2237.50 1850.55 16,110.00  

 

Three (3) 50KVA @ $ 2422.75 2311.50 9210.00  

Four (4) 75KVA @ $ 2706.25 2892.80 15,760.00  

 

Four (4) 100KVA @ $ 2963.95 2636.10 16,480.00  

Three Phase Dead Front Pad Mounted Transformers 

Five (5) 150KVA 120/240V @ $ 7268.10 7799.00 50,375.00  

 

Four (4) 300KVA 120/208V @ $ 9123.75 9912.50 49,660.00  

 

One (1) 1000KVA 277/480V @ $ 15,618.75 17,884.60 23,175.00  

 

Manufacturer: ABB Howard   

 

Delivery:  

12-14 Weeks 

20-22 Weeks 6-10 Weeks 14-18 Weeks  

 

Additional Information     


