



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3566 SUMMARY  
January 9, 2019 @ 10:30a.m.

Athletic Field and Golf Course Chemicals and Products for 2019	Ewing	Keeling	Site One Landscape	Agra Turf
Present at Bid Opening	No	No	No	No
*□ 28-3-10      *□ 24-6-12 1,512 (50 lb bags)	24-6-12 24,346.22	28-3-10 26,723.09	24-6-12 24418.80	28-3-10 26,989.20
24-6-12 320 (50 lb bags)	5152.64	5593.28	5168.00	5872.00
17-17-17 210 (50 lb bags)	650.00	No Bid	3334.80	3937.50
UMaxx 46-0-0 40 bags (50 lb bags)	1040.00	1273.92	1280.00	1344.00
Maxi Cal Calcium Nutrient Fertilizer 55 bags (50 lb bags)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	907.50
K-mag 00-00-22 Potassium Magnesium Sulfate 252 (50 lb bags)	No Bid	2889.94	13126.68	3402.00
Maxi Cal S Calcium Sulfate 350 (50 lb bags)	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	6212.50
Round up (Glyphosate) 60 gallons	798.44	Ranger Pro 2.5gal 818.28	Ranger Pro 840.00	792.00
Garlon 15 gallons	975.00	Remedy 2.5gal 1232.21	Lesco Triclopyr 4Ester 929.55	822.00

Opened by: Amy Smith  
Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3566 SUMMARY  
January 9, 2019 @ 10:30a.m.

Athletic Field and Golf Course Chemicals and Products for 2019	Ewing	Keeling	Site One Landscape	Agra Turf
Present at Bid Opening	No	No	No	No
Three-Way / Tri-mec (2, 4-D; Mecoprop-p; and Dicamba) 100 gallons)	2,438.94	Vessel 2.5gals 2429.48	2200.00	2280.00
Surfactant 10 gallons)	162.36	Drexel 107.27	88.00	95.00
Anti-foam 24 (16 oz bottles)	241.49	Deframer 163.97	Lesco Reccade 108.00	90.00
*Princept/Simazine □ 55 gallons □ 150 lbs of Water Dispensable Granule)	55gals. 1103.96	55gals. 1100.95	55gals. 1045.00	55gals. 1078.00
*Barricade(Prodiamine) □ 40 gallons □ 120 lbs of Water Dispensable Granule	40gals. 3440.27	40g - 2833.72 120lb - 1148.23	Lesco Stonewall 1026.00/120lbs.	40gals - 2320.00 120lb - 1090.80
Revolver (Foramsulfuron) 174 oz)	No bid	1154.00	Agency item 1177.00	1177.00
Certainty (Sulfosulfuron) 100 oz)	9472.42	Outrider 2091.16	7200.00	5920.00
Carbaryl Insecticide 100 gallons	No bid	Prokoz 4295.16	Lesco Sevin 4200.00	4160.00
Growth Regulator (Trinexapac-ethyl) 15 gallons	2158.20	Podium 2111.69	T-Nex 1950.00	1914.00

Opened by: Amy Smith  
Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3566 SUMMARY  
January 9, 2019 @ 10:30a.m.

Athletic Field and Golf Course Chemicals and Products for 2019	Ewing	Keeling	SiteOne Landscape	Agra Turf
Present at Bid Opening	No	No	No	No
Iron 12-0-0 100 gallons	1280.20	Ferromecac 1141.32 868.24	Lesco Iron 880.00	1120.00
Fire ant bait (advion) 100 lbs)	315.92	1248.17	1153.00	1156.00
Bifen 10 gallons	490.45	Avalon 364.95	Lesco Crosscheck 350.00	480.00
Quinclorac 75 DF 8 bottles (1 lb bottles)	377.49	Drive 297.28	Lesco Quin Way 319.60	312.00
Celsius WG 6 (7 oz bottles)	No bid	400.00	Agency item 612.00	612.00
Prodiamine 4L (Liquid) 42.5 Gallons	3,655.28	Resolute 2975.41	3485.00	3196.00
Princep (Liquid Simazine) 50 Gallons	1003.60	1000.86	950.00	980.00
80/20 Surfactant 25 Gallons	405.89	Drexel 268.18	Lesco Spreader 650.00	237.50
Specticle Flo 2 Gallons	No bid	3277.00	Agency item 3342.50	3342.50
Aloft GCSC 1 Gallon	No bid	576.21	1062.90	1064.00
Idemnify 2 (17.1 oz Bottles)	No bid	3300.00	Agency item 3400.00	3400.00

Opened by: Amy Smith  
Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3566 SUMMARY  
January 9, 2019 @ 10:30a.m.

Athletic Field and Golf Course Chemicals and Products for 2019	<i>Ewing</i>	<i>Keeling</i>	<i>Site One Landscape</i>	<i>Agra Turf</i>
<i>Present at Bid Opening</i>	<i>No</i>	<i>No</i>	<i>No</i>	<i>No</i>
Divanem 1 (64 oz Bottle)	<i>No bid</i>	<i>1558.49</i>	<i>Agency item 1558.50</i>	<i>1558.50</i>
Velista 10 (22 oz Bottles))	<i>No bid</i>	<i>2100.90</i>	<i>2101.00</i>	<i>2101.00</i>
Myclobutanil 5 Gallons	<i>750.17</i>	<i>Eagle 781.27</i>	<i>675.00</i>	<i>775.00</i>
Lexicon 2 (21 oz Bottles))	<i>No bid</i>	<i>1001.70</i>	<i>Agency item 1001.70</i>	<i>1028.00</i>
Thiophanate methyl (Liquid) 10 Gallons)	<i>No bid</i>	<i>Transom 503.08</i>	<i>Leeco Tstorm 460.00</i>	<i>680.00</i>
Azoxystrobin WG(Generic Only) 4 lbs	<i>746.37</i>	<i>Strobe 707.37</i>	<i>No Bid</i>	<i>696.00</i>
Tebuconazole (Liquid) 2 Gallons	<i>168.06</i>	<i>CL Torque 315.20</i>	<i>150.00</i>	<i>200.00</i>
ProStar 70WG 30 lbs	<i>No bid</i>	<i>1837.27</i>	<i>1850.10</i>	<i>1880.00</i>
Bayleton Flo 1 (2.5 Gallon container)	<i>No bid</i>	<i>1365.00</i>	<i>Agency item 1365.00</i>	<i>1385.00</i>
Trinexapac ethyl – Plant Regulation 7.5 Gallons	<i>No bid</i>	<i>Padium 1126.23</i>	<i>TNex 975.00</i>	<i>957.00</i>
Metsulfuron methyl 64 oz	<i>414.42</i>	<i>Patriot 172.30</i>	<i>MSM TURF 337.92</i>	<i>304.00</i>

Opened by: Amy Smith  
Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3566 SUMMARY  
 January 9, 2019 @ 10:30a.m.

Athletic Field and Golf Course Chemicals and Products for 2019	<i>Ewing</i>	<i>Keeling</i>	<i>Site One Landscape</i>	<i>Agra Turf</i>
<i>Present at Bid Opening</i>	<i>No</i>	<i>No</i>		
Halosulfuron (Generic) 25 oz)	<i>1192.17</i>	<i>Sedgettammer 1003.41</i>	<i>Prosege 1625.00</i>	<i>1007.00</i>
Negate (Metsulfuron methyl w/ Rimsulfuron) 6 (1.5 oz Bottles)	<i>343.95</i>	<i>328.42</i>	<i>312.00</i>	<i>312.00</i>
For those items with an option, vendors indicate which option is being priced.				

Opened by: Amy Smith  
 Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3566 SUMMARY  
January 9, 2019 @ 10:30a.m.

Athletic Field and Golf Course Chemicals and Products for 2019	Target Specialty Products			
Present at Bid Opening	No			
*□ 28-3-10      *□ 24-6-12 1,512 (50 lb bags)	No Bid			
24-6-12 320 (50 lb bags)	No Bid			
17-17-17 210 (50 lb bags)	No Bid			
UMaxx 46-0-0 40 bags (50 lb bags)	No Bid			
Maxi Cal Calcium Nutrient Fertilizer 55 bags (50 lb bags)	No Bid			
K-mag 00-00-22 Potassium Magnesium Sulfate 252 (50 lb bags)	No Bid			
Maxi Cal S Calcium Sulfate 350 (50 lb bags)	No Bid			
Round up (Glyphosate) 60 gallons	869.04			
Garlon 15 gallons	815.16			

Opened by: Amy Smith  
Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3566 SUMMARY

January 9, 2019 @ 10:30a.m.

Athletic Field and Golf Course Chemicals and Products for 2019	Target Specialty Products			
Present at Bid Opening	No			
Three-Way / Tri-mec (2, 4-D; Mecoprop-p; and Dicamba) 100 gallons)	2106.40			
Surfactant 10 gallons)	Halo 90 152.08			
Anti-foam 24 (16 oz bottles)	No Bid			
*Princept/Simazine □ 55 gallons □ 150 lbs of Water Dispensable Granule)	55gal 1146.86			
*Barricade(Prodiamine) □ 40 gallons □ 120 lbs of Water Dispensable Granule	Resolute 65WG 1155.60			
Revolver (Foramsulfuron) 174 oz)	1177.00			
Certainty (Sulfosulfuron) 100 oz)	No Bid			
Carbaryl Insecticide 100 gallons	5958.00			
Growth Regulator (Trinexapac-ethyl) 15 gallons	1740.72			

Opened by: Amy Smith  
Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3566 SUMMARY  
 January 9, 2019 @ 10:30a.m.

Athletic Field and Golf Course Chemicals and Products for 2019	<i>Target Specialty Products</i>			
<i>Present at Bid Opening</i>	<i>No</i>			
Iron 12-0-0 100 gallons	<i>1860.00</i>			
Fire ant bait (advion) 100 lbs)	<i>1168.64</i>			
Bifen 10 gallons	<i>299.40</i>			
Quinclorac 75 DF 8 bottles (1 lb bottles)	<i>No Bid</i>			
Celsius WG 6 (7 oz bottles)	<i>612.00</i>			
Prodiamine 4L (Liquid) 42.5 Gallons	<i>3071.90</i>			
Princep (Liquid Simazine) 50 Gallons	<i>1042.60</i>			
80/20 Surfactant 25 Gallons	<i>Haio 90 152.08</i>			
Specticle Flo 2 Gallons	<i>3342.50</i>			
Aloft GCSC 1 Gallon	<i>1062.90</i>			
Idemnify 2 (17.1 oz Bottles)	<i>No Bid</i>			

Opened by: Amy Smith  
 Summary by: Crystal Willis





CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3566 SUMMARY  
January 9, 2019 @ 10:30a.m.

Athletic Field and Golf Course Chemicals and Products for 2019	Target Specialty Products			
Present at Bid Opening	No			
Divanem 1 (64 oz Bottle)	No Bid			
Velista 10 (22 oz Bottles)	2101.00			
Myclobutanil 5 Gallons	No Bid			
Lexicon 2 (21 oz Bottles)	1001.70			
Thiophanate methyl (Liquid) 10 Gallons	939.24			
Azoxystrobin WG(Generic Only) 4 lbs	No Bid			
Tebuconazole (Liquid) 2 Gallons	286.60			
ProStar 70WG 30 lbs	No Bid			
Bayleton Flo 1 (2.5 Gallon container)	1385.00			
Trinexapac ethyl - Plant Regulation 7.5 Gallons	870.36			
Metsulfuron methyl 64 oz	183.40			

Opened by: Amy Smith  
Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3566 SUMMARY  
 January 9, 2019 @ 10:30a.m.

Athletic Field and Golf Course Chemicals and Products for 2019	<i>Target Specialty Products</i>			
<i>Present at Bid Opening</i>				
Halosulfuron (Generic) 25 oz)	<i>No Bid</i>			
Negate (Metsulfuron methyl w/ Rimsulfuron) 6 (1.5 oz Bottles)	<i>300.<sup>00</sup></i>			
For those items with an option, vendors indicate which option is being priced.				

Opened by: Amy Smith  
 Summary by: Crystal Willis