



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3557 SUMMARY
 Friday, November 16, 2018 @ 10:00a.m.

Special Operations Equipment for the North Little Rock Fire Department	Henard Utility	EVS	Technical Rescue
<i>Present at Bid Opening</i>			
Category A. – Rescue			
A #1 Boat	No Bid	24,734.96	No Bid
A #2 Rescue Boards	No Bid	895.14	No Bid
A #3 Small Inflatable Boar	No Bid	2716.22	No Bid
A #4 Lights	No Bid	653.88	No Bid
A #5 Spot Lights	No Bid	295.14	No Bid
A #6 Throw Bags	No Bid	726.56	1032.00
A #7 Paddles	No Bid	94.04	No Bid
A #8 Rescue Adjunct	No Bid	128.10	148.10

Opened by: Amy Smith
 Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3557 SUMMARY
 Friday, November 16, 2018 @ 10:00a.m.

Special Operations Equipment for the North Little Rock Fire Department	Henard	EVS	Technical Rescue
<i>Present at Bid Opening</i>			
Category B. – Rescue			
B #1 Stokes Basket	No Bid	No Bid	1407.55
B #2 Carabineers	No Bid	718.90	1575.00
B #3 Auto Belay System	No Bid	455.68	577.90
Category C. – Urban Search & Rescue			
C #1 Con-Space Searchcam Hasty Search Kit	No Bid	12,704.86	13,514.80
C #2 Stanley System	48,460.24	No Bid	No Bid

Opened by: Amy Smith
 Summary by: Crystal Willis



CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3557 SUMMARY
 Friday, November 16, 2018 @ 10:00a.m.

Special Operations Equipment for the North Little Rock Fire Department	Henard	EVS	Technical Rescue
<i>Present at Bid Opening</i>			
Category D. – Trench			
D #1 Struts	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
D #2 Prussic Cord	No Bid	168.66	186.00
Category E. – Extrication Equipment			
E #1 Struts	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

Opened by: Amy Smith
 Summary by: Crystal Willis