NR

CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3549 SUMMARY
Tuesday, October 2, 2018 @ 10:00a.m.

{

RFP for Janitorial Services for Four

Southern Maid

Community Centers Jonitorial Services Global Janitorial Jani King Sharp Cleaning
Present at Bid Opening No Yes No No
$2,000 Bid Bond Yes Yes No Bid Bond Yes
Attended (4) Mandatory Site Visits Yes Yes Yes
North Heights Community Center 1400.00 1098.00 No Bid Bond 2400.00
Sherman Park Community Center 1200.00 1098.00 No Bid Bond 1625.00
Glenview Community Center 1200.00 1098.00 No Bid Bond 1675.00
Rose City Community Center 1400.00 1098.00 No Bid Bond 1675.00
Total $ 5200.00 4392.00 No Bid Bond 7375.00

North Little Rock.

Price is only one of several factors comprising the evaluation criteria. Award is made to the qualified bidder whose bid substantially
conforms to the requirements set forth on the solicitation documents and is judged to be the most advantageous offer to the City of

Opened by: Amy Smith
Summary by: Crystal Willis




g CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 18-3549 SUMMARY
Tuesday, October 2, 2018 @ 10:00a.m.

RFP for Janitorial Services for Four | AR Finest Cleaning
Community Centers Services

Present at Bid Opening No

$2,000 Bid Bond No Bid Bond

Attended (4) Mandatory Site Visits

North Heights Community Center No Bid Bond

Sherman Park Community Cenfer No Bid Bond

Glenview Community Center No Bid Bond

Rose City Community Center No Bid Bond

Total $ No Bid Bond

Price is only one of several factors comprising the evaluation criteria. Award is made to the qualified bidder whose bid substantially
conforms to the requirements set forth on the solicitation documents and is judged to be the most advantageous offer to the City of
North Little Rock.

Opened by: Amy Smith
Summary by: Crystal Willis




