

ITEM NO	Description	MFG	MFG NO	SUB	EST AVG QTY	UOM	UNIT PRICE	COMMENTS/NOTATIONS
XAT00002	ARM, MAST 2" x 29" (FLOOD LIGHT BRACKET)		AMI-462		100	EACH	33.65	UTIL MET P2005016C
XAT0008S	ARM, MAST 2" x 8'				75	EACH	55.28	UTIL MET P2005080
XFL0AELED	FLOOD LIGHT, AEL-LED	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	ACPOLED P50 MVOLT 66 YJ BZ MP P7 0643 NL	N	120	EACH	469.57	
XLA100HPS	LAMP, 1000W HPS (LU1000)	SYLVANIA	67307		60	EACH	26.20	
XLA100MH	LAMP, 1000/U MH				60	EACH	17.23	Venture 72051
XLA10HPS	LAMP, 100W HPS S-54				60	EACH	5.90	Plus Rite 2006/2045
XLA10MH	LAMP, 100/U MH MEDIUM BASE	SYLVANIA	64468		60	EACH	9.35	Plus Rite 1035
XLA150MH	LAMP, 150W MH		MS-150-MGL		120	EACH	9.53	Plus Rite 1013
XLA15HPS	LAMP, 150W /55W S-55				120	EACH	6.90	Plus Rite 2046
XLA27WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 27W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED27HID-E26-840-D/G2	N	120	EACH	35.99	
XLA32MH	LAMP, 320W MH LAMP (MOGUL E39 BASE)		MS320/U/PS		60	EACH	15.42	Plus Rite 1578
XLA36WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 36W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED36HID-EX39-840-D/G3	N	120	EACH	37.75	
XLA40MH	LAMP, 400W MH	SYLVANIA	64490		120	EACH	9.70	Syl 64036
XLA54WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 54W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED54HID-EX39-850-D/G3	N	120	EACH	46.62	
XLA80WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 80W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED80HID-EX39-840-D	N	120	EACH	87.95	
XLNWALED	ASSEMBLY, 6600 LUMEN NEMA HEAD PACKAGE * *PACKAGE INCLUDES LNH2REF ACRYLIC REFRACTOR	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2PKGLU5MVOLTR5NAP7	N	50	EACH	157.61	
XLNWHLED	HEAD, 6600 LUMEN LED NEMA NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNHWLU5MVOLTRNAP7PCSS	N	50	EACH	146.75	
XLU072LED	72W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-72W32LED4K-T-R3M-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	1,000	EACH	203.20	
XLU108LED	108W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-108W32LED4K-T-REM-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	100	EACH	227.66	
XNWREFR	REFRACTOR, ACRYLIC (FOR BA) NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2REF	N	60	EACH	15.41	
XPD00001	POLE ACCESSORIES - BASE, SCREW-IN	CHANCE	11242NG4VP		12	EACH	No Bid	
XPD00002	POLE ACCESSORIES - REPAIR KIT, X-BASE FIELD (HAPCO)	HAPCO	74000		60	EACH	No Bid	
XPD00003	POLES ACCESSORIES -BASE, TRANSFORMER	HAPCO	70501		20	EACH	No Bid	
XPD00025	POLE, AL 25' (FOR RESIDENTIAL) SGL ARM	VALMONT	See attached specifications		60	EACH	No Bid	
XPD00030	POLE, AL 30' SGL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-001		90	EACH	No Bid	
XPD00031	POLE, AL 30' DBL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-002		30	EACH	No Bid	
XPEDCTL	CONTROLS, PE DUAL VOLTAGE (105-305V, 50-60HZ)	SUN TECH	SX124-1.5-STM		1,500	EACH	6.12	DTL DX124-12A-J50
XPEPLUG	CAP, SHORTING RIPLEY	RIPLEY	BLACK COVER 6005		500	EACH	3.23	DTL Dshort-VBK-J50
XPESOCK	SOCKET, PE CONTROL PRECISION #M2A	PRECISION	M2A		100	EACH	8.75	DTL-DUR103J6

ITEM NO	Description	MFG	MFG NO	SUB	EST AVG QTY	UOM	UNIT PRICE	COMMENTS/NOTATIONS
XAT00002	ARM, MAST 2" x 29" (FLOOD LIGHT BRACKET)		AMI-462		100	EACH	35.29	
XAT0008S	ARM, MAST 2" x 8'				75	EACH	No Bid	
XFL0AELED	FLOOD LIGHT, AEL-LED	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	ACPOLED P50 MVOLT 66 YJ BZ MP P7 0643 NL	N	120	EACH	425.53	
XLA100HPS	LAMP, 1000W HPS (LU1000)	SYLVANIA	67307		60	EACH	27.09	
XLA100MH	LAMP, 1000/U MH				60	EACH	21.06	
XLA10HPS	LAMP, 100W HPS S-54				60	EACH	11.13	
XLA10MH	LAMP, 100/U MH MEDIUM BASE	SYLVANIA	64468		60	EACH	11.70	
XLA150MH	LAMP, 150W MH		MS-150-MGL		120	EACH	13.13	
XLA15HPS	LAMP, 150W /55W S-55				120	EACH	8.78	
XLA27WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 27W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED27HID-E26-840-D/G2	N	120	EACH	No Bid	
XLA32MH	LAMP, 320W MH LAMP (MOGUL E39 BASE)		MS320/U/PS		60	EACH	No Bid	
XLA36WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 36W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED36HID-EX39-840-D/G3	N	120	EACH	No Bid	
XLA40MH	LAMP, 400W MH	SYLVANIA	64490		120	EACH	10.15	
XLA54WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 54W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED54HID-EX39-850-D/G3	N	120	EACH	No Bid	
XLA80WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 80W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED80HID-EX39-840-D	N	120	EACH	No Bid	
XLNWALED	ASSEMBLY, 6600 LUMEN NEMA HEAD PACKAGE * *PACKAGE INCLUDES LNH2REF ACRYLIC REFRACTOR	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2PKGLU5MVOLTR5NAP7	N	50	EACH	142.10	
XLNWHLED	HEAD, 6600 LUMEN LED NEMA NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNHWLU5MVOLTRNAP7PCSS	N	50	EACH	131.58	
XLU072LED	72W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-72W32LED4K-T-R3M-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	1,000	EACH	No Bid	
XLU108LED	108W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-108W32LED4K-T-REM-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	100	EACH	No Bid	
XNWREFR	REFRACTOR, ACRYLIC (FOR BA) NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2REF	N	60	EACH	12.63	
XPD00001	POLE ACCESSORIES - BASE, SCREW-IN	CHANCE	11242NG4VP		12	EACH	No Bid	
XPD00002	POLE ACCESSORIES - REPAIR KIT, X-BASE FIELD (HAPCO)	HAPCO	74000		60	EACH	562.88	
XPD00003	POLES ACCESSORIES -BASE, TRANSFORMER	HAPCO	70501		20	EACH	283.50	
XPD00025	POLE, AL 25' (FOR RESIDENTIAL) SGL ARM	VALMONT	See attached specifications		60	EACH	788.00	
XPD00030	POLE, AL 30' SGL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-001		90	EACH	1941.00	
XPD00031	POLE, AL 30' DBL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-002		30	EACH	2224.75	
XPEDCTL	CONTROLS, PE DUAL VOLTAGE (105-305V, 50-60HZ)	SUN TECH	SX124-1.5-STM		1,500	EACH	4.68	
XPEPLUG	CAP, SHORTING RIPLEY	RIPLEY	BLACK COVER 6005		500	EACH	2.95	
XPESOCK	SOCKET, PE CONTROL PRECISION #M2A	PRECISION	M2A		100	EACH	6.38	

ITEM NO	Description	MFG	MFG NO	SUB	EST AVG QTY	UOM	UNIT PRICE	COMMENTS/NOTATIONS
XAT00002	ARM, MAST 2" x 29" (FLOOD LIGHT BRACKET)		AMI-462		100	EACH	34.10	
XAT0008S	ARM, MAST 2" x 8'				75	EACH	50.50	
XFL0AELED	FLOOD LIGHT, AEL-LED	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	ACPOLED P50 MVOLT 66 YJ BZ MP P7 0643 NL	N	120	EACH	434.75	
XLA100HPS	LAMP, 1000W HPS (LU1000)	SYLVANIA	67307		60	EACH	30.50	
XLA100MH	LAMP, 1000/U MH				60	EACH	19.15	
XLA10HPS	LAMP, 100W HPS S-54				60	EACH	12.50	
XLA10MH	LAMP, 100/U MH MEDIUM BASE	SYLVANIA	64468		60	EACH	17.00	
XLA150MH	LAMP, 150W MH		MS-150-MGL		120	EACH	8.25	
XLA15HPS	LAMP, 150W /55W S-55				120	EACH	6.75	
XLA27WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 27W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED27HID-E26-840-D/G2	N	120	EACH	No Bid	
XLA32MH	LAMP, 320W MH LAMP (MOGUL E39 BASE)		MS320/U/PS		60	EACH	No Bid	
XLA36WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 36W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED36HID-EX39-840-D/G3	N	120	EACH	No Bid	
XLA40MH	LAMP, 400W MH	SYLVANIA	64490		120	EACH	8.50	
XLA54WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 54W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED54HID-EX39-850-D/G3	N	120	EACH	No Bid	
XLA80WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 80W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED80HID-EX39-840-D	N	120	EACH	No Bid	
XLNWALED	ASSEMBLY, 6600 LUMEN NEMA HEAD PACKAGE * *PACKAGE INCLUDES LNH2REF ACRYLIC REFRACTOR	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2PKGLU5MVOLTR5NAP7	N	50	EACH	146.75	
XLNWHLED	HEAD, 6600 LUMEN LED NEMA NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNHWLU5MVOLTRNAP7PCSS	N	50	EACH	135.87	
XLU072LED	72W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-72W32LED4K-T-R3M-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	1,000	EACH	No Bid	
XLU108LED	108W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-108W32LED4K-T-REM-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	100	EACH	No Bid	
XNWREFR	REFRACTOR, ACRYLIC (FOR BA) NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2REF	N	60	EACH	13.50	
XPD00001	POLE ACCESSORIES - BASE, SCREW-IN	CHANCE	11242NG4VP		12	EACH	No Bid	
XPD00002	POLE ACCESSORIES - REPAIR KIT, X-BASE FIELD (HAPCO)	HAPCO	74000		60	EACH	450.00	
XPD00003	POLES ACCESSORIES -BASE, TRANSFORMER	HAPCO	70501		20	EACH	275.00	
XPD00025	POLE, AL 25' (FOR RESIDENTIAL) SGL ARM	VALMONT	See attached specifications		60	EACH	No Bid	
XPD00030	POLE, AL 30' SGL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-001		90	EACH	2100.00	
XPD00031	POLE, AL 30' DBL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-002		30	EACH	2400.00	
XPEDCTL	CONTROLS, PE DUAL VOLTAGE (105-305V, 50-60HZ)	SUN TECH	SX124-1.5-STM		1,500	EACH	4.90	
XPEPLUG	CAP, SHORTING RIPLEY	RIPLEY	BLACK COVER 6005		500	EACH	3.10	
XPESOCK	SOCKET, PE CONTROL PRECISION #M2A	PRECISION	M2A		100	EACH	6.75	

ITEM NO	Description	MFG	MFG NO	SUB	EST AVG QTY	UOM	UNIT PRICE	COMMENTS/NOTATIONS
XAT00002	ARM, MAST 2" x 29" (FLOOD LIGHT BRACKET)		AMI-462		100	EACH	25-	Action
XAT0008S	ARM, MAST 2" x 8'				75	EACH	70-	Action
XFL0AELED	FLOOD LIGHT, AEL-LED	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	ACPOLED P50 MVOLT 66 YJ BZ MP P7 0643 NL	N	120	EACH	899.-	Cooper
XLA100HPS	LAMP, 1000W HPS (LU1000)	SYLVANIA	67307		60	EACH	33.-	Howard
XLA100MH	LAMP, 1000/U MH				60	EACH	21.-	
XLA10HPS	LAMP, 100W HPS S-54				60	EACH	6.50	
XLA10MH	LAMP, 100/U MH MEDIUM BASE	SYLVANIA	64468		60	EACH	8.35	
XLA150MH	LAMP, 150W MH		MS-150-MGL		120	EACH	8.75	
XLA15HPS	LAMP, 150W /55W S-55				120	EACH	9.5	
XLA27WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 27W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED27HID-E26-840-D/G2	N	120	EACH	NB	
XLA32MH	LAMP, 320W MH LAMP (MOGUL E39 BASE)		MS320/U/PS		60	EACH	NB	
XLA36WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 36W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED36HID-EX39-840-D/G3	N	120	EACH	NB	
XLA40MH	LAMP, 400W MH	SYLVANIA	64490		120	EACH	9.75	Howard
XLA54WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 54W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED54HID-EX39-850-D/G3	N	120	EACH	NB	
XLA80WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 80W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED80HID-EX39-840-D	N	120	EACH	NB	
XLNWALED	ASSEMBLY, 6600 LUMEN NEMA HEAD PACKAGE * *PACKAGE INCLUDES LNH2REF ACRYLIC REFRACTOR	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2PKGLU5MVOLTR5NAP7	N	50	EACH	147.-	Cooper
XLNWHLED	HEAD, 6600 LUMEN LED NEMA NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNHWLU5MVOLTRNAP7PCSS	N	50	EACH	165.-	Cooper
XLU072LED	72W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-72W32LED4K-T-R3M-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	1,000	EACH	222.-	Cooper
XLU108LED	108W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-108W32LED4K-T-REM-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	100	EACH	358.-	Cooper
XNWREFR	REFRACTOR, ACRYLIC (FOR BA) NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2REF	N	60	EACH	11.50	
XPD00001	POLE ACCESSORIES - BASE, SCREW-IN	CHANCE	11242NG4VP		12	EACH	NB	
XPD00002	POLE ACCESSORIES - REPAIR KIT, X-BASE FIELD (HAPCO)	HAPCO	74000		60	EACH	607.-	
XPD00003	POLES ACCESSORIES -BASE, TRANSFORMER	HAPCO	70501		20	EACH	306.-	
XPD00025	POLE, AL 25' (FOR RESIDENTIAL) SGL ARM	VALMONT	See attached specifications		60	EACH	1118.-	
XPD00030	POLE, AL 30' SGL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-001		90	EACH	1985.-	
XPD00031	POLE, AL 30' DBL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-002		30	EACH	2275.-	
XPEDCTL	CONTROLS, PE DUAL VOLTAGE (105-305V, 50-60HZ)	SUN TECH	SX124-1.5-STM		1,500	EACH	5.25	
XPEPLUG	CAP, SHORTING RIPLEY	RIPLEY	BLACK COVER 6005		500	EACH	NB	
XPESOCK	SOCKET, PE CONTROL PRECISION #M2A	PRECISION	M2A		100	EACH	NB	

ITEM NO	Description	MFG	MFG NO	SUB	EST AVG QTY	UOM	UNIT PRICE	COMMENTS/NOTATIONS
XAT00002	ARM, MAST 2" x 29" (FLOOD LIGHT BRACKET)		AMI-462		100	EACH	N/Q	
XAT0008S	ARM, MAST 2" x 8'				75	EACH	1	
XFL0ALED	FLOOD LIGHT, AEL-LED	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	ACPOLED P50 MVOLT 66 YJ BZ MP P7 0643 NL	N	120	EACH		
XLA100HPS	LAMP, 1000W HPS (LU1000)	SYLVANIA	67307		60	EACH	49.50	
XLA100MH	LAMP, 1000/U MH				60	EACH	32.-	
XLA10HPS	LAMP, 100W HPS S-54				60	EACH	15.50	
XLA10MH	LAMP, 100/U MH MEDIUM BASE	SYLVANIA	64468		60	EACH	19.90	
XLA150MH	LAMP, 150W MH		MS-150-MGL		120	EACH	N/Q	
XLA15HPS	LAMP, 150W /55W S-55				120	EACH	1	
XLA27WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 27W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED27HID-E26-840-D/G2	N	120	EACH	38.-	
XLA32MH	LAMP, 320W MH LAMP (MOGUL E39 BASE)		MS320/U/PS		60	EACH	N/Q	
XLA36WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 36W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED36HID-EX39-840-D/G3	N	120	EACH	42.-	
XLA40MH	LAMP, 400W MH	SYLVANIA	64490		120	EACH	12.50	
XLA54WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 54W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED54HID-EX39-850-D/G3	N	120	EACH	45.-	
XLA80WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 80W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED80HID-EX39-840-D	N	120	EACH	92.-	
XLNWALED	ASSEMBLY, 6600 LUMEN NEMA HEAD PACKAGE * *PACKAGE INCLUDES LNH2REF ACRYLIC REFRACTOR	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2PKGLU5MVOLTR5NAP7	N	50	EACH	N/Q	
XLNWHLED	HEAD, 6600 LUMEN LED NEMA NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNHWLU5MVOLTRNAP7PCSS	N	50	EACH		
XLU072LED	72W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-72W32LED4K-T-R3M-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	1,000	EACH		
XLU108LED	108W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-108W32LED4K-T-REM-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	100	EACH		
XNWREFR	REFRACTOR, ACRYLIC (FOR BA) NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2REF	N	60	EACH		
XPD00001	POLE ACCESSORIES - BASE, SCREW-IN	CHANCE	11242NG4VP		12	EACH		
XPD00002	POLE ACCESSORIES - REPAIR KIT, X-BASE FIELD (HAPCO)	HAPCO	74000		60	EACH		
XPD00003	POLES ACCESSORIES -BASE, TRANSFORMER	HAPCO	70501		20	EACH		
XPD00025	POLE, AL 25' (FOR RESIDENTIAL) SGL ARM	VALMONT	See attached specifications		60	EACH		
XPD00030	POLE, AL 30' SGL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-001		90	EACH		
XPD00031	POLE, AL 30' DBL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-002		30	EACH		
XPEDCTL	CONTROLS, PE DUAL VOLTAGE (105-305V, 50-60HZ)	SUN TECH	SX124-1.5-STM		1,500	EACH		
XPEPLUG	CAP, SHORTING RIPLEY	RIPLEY	BLACK COVER 6005		500	EACH		
XPESOCK	SOCKET, PE CONTROL PRECISION #M2A	PRECISION	M2A		100	EACH		

ITEM NO	Description	MFG	MFG NO	SUB	EST AVG QTY	UOM	UNIT PRICE	COMMENTS/NOTATIONS
XAT00002	ARM, MAST 2" x 29" (FLOOD LIGHT BRACKET)	<i>Salco</i>	<i>AMI-462</i> <i>WP-125-25-S</i>		100	EACH	<i>22.60</i>	
XAT0008S	ARM, MAST 2" x 8'	<i>Salco</i>	<i>WP-2-8-S</i>		75	EACH	<i>54.74</i>	
XFLOAELED	FLOOD LIGHT, AEL-LED	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	ACPOLED P50 MVOLT 66 YJ BZ MP P7 0643 NL	N	120	EACH	<i>NIB</i>	
XLA100HPS	LAMP, 1000W HPS (LU1000)	SYLVANIA	67307		60	EACH	<i> </i>	
XLA100MH	LAMP, 1000/U MH				60	EACH		
XLA10HPS	LAMP, 100W HPS S-54				60	EACH		
XLA10MH	LAMP, 100/U MH MEDIUM BASE	SYLVANIA	64468		60	EACH		
XLA150MH	LAMP, 150W MH		MS-150-MGL		120	EACH		
XLA15HPS	LAMP, 150W /55W S-55				120	EACH		
XLA27WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 27W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED27HID-E26-840-D/G2	N	120	EACH		
XLA32MH	LAMP, 320W MH LAMP (MOGUL E39 BASE)		MS320/U/PS		60	EACH		
XLA36WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 36W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED36HID-EX39-840-D/G3	N	120	EACH		
XLA40MH	LAMP, 400W MH	SYLVANIA	64490		120	EACH		
XLA54WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 54W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED54HID-EX39-850-D/G3	N	120	EACH		
XLA80WLHR	LAMP, LED RETRO FIT MH 80W	KEYSTONE	KT-LED80HID-EX39-840-D	N	120	EACH		
XLNWALED	ASSEMBLY, 6600 LUMEN NEMA HEAD PACKAGE * <i>*PACKAGE INCLUDES LNH2REF ACRYLIC REFRACTOR</i>	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2PKGLU5MVOLTR5NAP7	N	50	EACH	<i>152.40</i>	
XLNWHLED	HEAD, 6600 LUMEN LED NEMA NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNHWLU5MVOLTRNAP7PCSS	N	50	EACH	<i>14.10</i>	
XLU072LED	72W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-72W32LED4K-T-R3M-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	1,000	EACH	<i>191.00</i>	
XLU108LED	108W LED LIGHT FIXTURE	PHILIPS	JTRCM-108W32LED4K-T-REM-UNIV-DMG-RCD7-WC10-GY3	N	100	EACH	<i>24.-</i>	
XNWREFR	REFRACTOR, ACRYLIC (FOR BA) NIGHT WATCHER	AMERICAN ELECTRIC	LNH2REF	N	60	EACH	<i>13.80</i>	
XPD00001	POLE ACCESSORIES - BASE, SCREW-IN	CHANCE	11242NG4VP		12	EACH	<i>NIB</i>	
XPD00002	POLE ACCESSORIES - REPAIR KIT, X-BASE FIELD (HAPCO)	HAPCO	74000		60	EACH	<i>587.-</i>	
XPD00003	POLES ACCESSORIES -BASE, TRANSFORMER	HAPCO	70501		20	EACH	<i>297.-</i>	
XPD00025	POLE, AL 25' (FOR RESIDENTIAL) SGL ARM	VALMONT	<i>See attached specifications</i>		60	EACH	<i>NB</i>	
XPD00030	POLE, AL 30' SGL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-001		90	EACH	<i>1928.-</i>	
XPD00031	POLE, AL 30' DBL BRK (25'8")	HAPCO	73339-002		30	EACH	<i>2269.-</i>	
XPEDCTL	CONTROLS, PE DUAL VOLTAGE (105-305V, 50-60HZ)	SUN TECH	SX124-1.5-STM		1,500	EACH	<i>5-</i>	<i>AMER elect</i>
XPEPLUG	CAP, SHORTING RIPLEY	RIPLEY	BLACK COVER 6005		500	EACH	<i>3.10</i>	
XPESOCK	SOCKET, PE CONTROL PRECISION #M2A	PRECISION	M2A		100	EACH	<i>6.95</i>	<i>AMER elec</i>