
         CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 21-3692 BID SUMMARY                     

         March 16, 2021 @ 10:00 a.m. 

Opened by:   Amy Smith 

Summary by: Crystal Willis 

 

  
 

Transformers for the NLR Electric 

Department 
 

AR Electric 

Coop Inc. 
Techline Techline 

Technology 

International Inc.  

Single Phase 25KVA 120/240 @ Each 
2038.00* 2296.00 2230.00 2245.00 

Single Phase 50KVA 120/240 @ Each 
2377.00* 2620.00 2510.00 2594.00 

Single Phase 75KVA 120/240 @ Each 
2706.50* 3590.00 2725.00 3263.00 

Three Phase 150KVA 120/208 @ Each 
7510.75 9495.00 7900.00 10,696.00 

Three Phase 300KVA 120/208 @ Each 
9565.25 11,865.00 10,930.00 12,625.00 

Three Phase 300KVA 277/480@ Each 
9017.50 11,985.00 10,070.00 11,915.00 

Three Phase 750KVA 120/208 @ Each 
17,712.00 24,600.00 18,540.00 22,261.00 

Three Phase 750KVA 277/480 @ Each 
15,141.25 19,860.00 15,115.00 19,131.00 

Three Phase 1000KVA 277/480 @ Each 
17,599.00 23,995.00 18,490.00 22,226.00 

Three Phase 2500KVA 277/480 @ Each 
33,000.00 56,775.00 35,360.00 40,500.00 

Manufacturer Ermco Howard 

 

ABB Maddox 

Delivery 

*30-32 Wks  

18-20 Wks 20 Wks 22 Wks 38-40 Wks 
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Transformers for the NLR Electric 

Department 
 

Paradoxe    

Single Phase 25KVA 120/240 @ Each 
No Bid    

Single Phase 50KVA 120/240 @ Each 
No Bid    

Single Phase 75KVA 120/240 @ Each 
No Bid    

Three Phase 150KVA 120/208 @ Each 
No Bid    

Three Phase 300KVA 120/208 @ Each 
No Bid    

Three Phase 300KVA 277/480@ Each 
No Bid    

Three Phase 750KVA 120/208 @ Each 
21,802.00    

Three Phase 750KVA 277/480 @ Each 
19,316.00    

Three Phase 1000KVA 277/480 @ Each 
23,056.00    

Three Phase 2500KVA 277/480 @ Each 
41,320.00    

Manufacturer Magnetron    

Delivery 16 Wks    


