
         CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 23-3834 BID SUMMARY                     

         November 9, 2023, 2023 @ 10:00 a.m. 

Opened by: Amy Smith 

Recorded by: Sheila Harper 

 

  
 
 

Transformers for the North Little Rock 

Electric Department 

Blackstar 

Diviersified 
Irby Utilities AR Electric Fleming Electric 

 

Single Phase (25) 25KVA 120/240 
9584.00/E  No Bid 3,500.00/E 

 

 

(30) 50KVA  120/240 
10,600.00/E No Bid 4,080.00/E  

(15) 75KVA  120/240 
12,252.00/E No Bid 4,875.00/E  

(15) 100KVA  120/240 
13,614.00/E No Bid 5,770.00/E  

(15) 167KVA  120/240 
16,090.00/E No Bid 7,880.00/E  

(10) 250KVA  120/240 
20,722.00/E No Bid 11,275.00/E  

 Three Phase (5) 150KVA  120/208 
31,984.00/E 26,463.00/E* No Bid  

(3) 150KVA  277/480 
29,599.00/E 25,406.00/E* No Bid  

(7) 300KVA  120/208 
38,161.00/E 35,676.00/E* No Bid  

(15) 300KVA  277/480 
35,725.00/E 33,497.00/E* No Bid  

(4) 500KVA  120/208 
44,548.00/E 51,709.00/E* No Bid  



         CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 23-3834 BID SUMMARY                     

         November 9, 2023, 2023 @ 10:00 a.m. 

Opened by: Amy Smith 

Recorded by: Sheila Harper 

 

 
 
 

Transformers for the North Little Rock 

Electric Department 

Blackstar 

Diviersified 
Irby Utilities AR Electric  

 

(8) 500KVA 277/480 
41,714.00/E 41,534.00/E* No Bid 

 

 

(5) 750KVA  120/208 
52,347.00/E 61,454.00/E* No Bid  

(5) 750KVA  277/480 
49,032.00/E 53,948.00/E* No Bid  

(5) 1000KVA  120/208 
60,209.00/E 88,420.00/E No Bid  

(7) 1000KVA  277/480 
56,393.00/E 54,397.00/E No Bid  

(4) 1500KVA  120/208 
77,203.00/E No Bid No Bid  

(5) 1500KVA  277/480 
72,268.00/E 74,423.00/E No Bid  

(3) 2000KVA  277/480 
87,805.00/E 98,055.00/E No Bid 80,449.00/E 

(10) 2500KVA  277/480 
105,153.00/E 129,580.00/E No Bid 99,627.00E 

Manufacturer 
JST Power Eqpt WEG Ermco Magneteon SAS 

ETA: 
 

*108-110 

84-86 Wks 
Q4 2024 52-54 Weeks 



         CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 23-3834 BID SUMMARY                     

         November 9, 2023, 2023 @ 10:00 a.m. 

Opened by: Amy Smith 

Recorded by: Sheila Harper 

 

 
  
 

Transformers for the North Little Rock 

Electric Department 
Wesco Wesco Wesco  

 

Single Phase (25) 25KVA 120/240 
(10) 7,553.00/E*  11,758.00/E* No Bid 

 

 

(30) 50KVA  120/240 
(10) 8,670.00/E* 13,664.00/E* No Bid  

(15) 75KVA  120/240 
(2) 9,641.00/E* 16,984.00/E* No Bid  

(15) 100KVA  120/240 
No Bid 17,812.00/E* No Bid  

(15) 167KVA  120/240 
(4) 15,708.00* 22,230.00/E* No Bid  

(10) 250KVA  120/240 
No Bid 31,187.00/E* No Bid  

 Three Phase (5) 150KVA  120/208 
(3) 17,998.00 30,758.00/E 27,601.00/E*  

(3) 150KVA  277/480 
18,000.00/E 28,309.00/E 26,498.00/E*  

(7) 300KVA  120/208 
(2) 25,440.00/E 36,535.00/E 37,210.00/E*  

(15) 300KVA  277/480 
(2) 25,445.00/E 37,880.00/E 34,937.00/E*  

(4) 500KVA  120/208 
(2) 37,940.00/E 53,138.00/E 53,933.00/E*  



         CITY OF NORTH LITTLE ROCK 23-3834 BID SUMMARY                     

         November 9, 2023, 2023 @ 10:00 a.m. 

Opened by: Amy Smith 

Recorded by: Sheila Harper 

 

 

Transformers for the North Little Rock 

Electric Department 
Wesco Wesco Wesco  

 

(8) 500KVA 277/480 
(2) 37,945.00/E 47,449.00/E 43,320.00/E* 

 

 

(5) 750KVA  120/208 
(1) 52,440.00/E 71,737.00/E 64,096.00/E*  

(5) 750KVA  277/480 
(1) 52,445.00/E 61,899.00/E 56,268.00/E*  

(5) 1000KVA  120/208 
(1) 69,443.00/E 87,724.00/E 92,124.00/E  

(7) 1000KVA  277/480 
No Bid 91,435.00/E 56,736.00/E  

(4) 1500KVA  120/208 
(1) 95,997.00/E 177.535.00/E No Bid  

(5) 1500KVA  277/480 
(1) 96,000.00/E 103,911.00/E 77,623.00/E  

(3) 2000KVA  277/480 
(1) 125,554.00/ 125.292.00/E 102,272.00/E  

(10) 2500KVA  277/480 
No Bid 155,035.00/E 135,153.00/E  

Manufacturer 

MS-TN (They can 

only provide the 

quantities noted. 

Howard Industries WEG  

ETA: 

*28-34 Wks 

38-44 Wks 

* 72Wks 

52Wks 

*108-110 Wks 

84-86 Wks 
 


